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TOWN OF CONCORD BID OPENING    April 30, 2012 

Gravel Bid Opening 

 

 PRESENT: GARY A. EPPOLITO, SUPERVISOR 

   DARLENE G. SCHWEIKERT, TOWN CLERK 

   DENNIS M. DAINS, HIGHWAY SUPT. 

   William Phillips, Gernatt Asphalt Products    

    

   Supervisor Eppolito opened the bid opening at 10:00 am.  Town Clerk 

Schweikert had received six sealed bids.   Supervisor Eppolito opened the bids as follows: 

  

   Buffalo Crushed Stone  McEwan Trucking        
      2544 Clinton Street, PO Box 710 11696 Glenwood Rd 

   Buffalo, NY 14224   East Concord, NY 14055 

     

    Picked Up    Picked Up 

Gravel Products     

Bank Run    No Bid     $5.25                

 

Screened Gravel 

     1"     No Bid      $7.25         

     2"     No Bid        $5.75          

     3"         No Bid        $5.70                                   

     4"         No Bid     $5.60            

  

Oversize Rock-No more than 10% less than 2” on 

  2” to –8”     No Bid        $8.50                

  8” & up      No Bid     $20.00                   

  

Crusher Run–2  No Bid     No Bid                    

-2”C/R Gravel H.H.  No Bid     No Bid        

 

Limestone Products              

#1ACrushed Stone  $15.10         No Bid     

#1 Crushed Stone  $14.55         No Bid        

#1 & #2 Crushed  

    Stone Mixed  $13.15     No Bid 

          

Surge Rock- 

6”-8”     $11.35 (4”-12” nominal)  No Bid                   

8” & up   No Bid 

 

Topsoil 

Screened    No Bid     $22.00                  

Unscreened    No Bid     $12.50                   

 

 

 

   Gernatt Asphalt Products  D&H Excavating        
      13870 Taylor Hollow Rd  11939 Route 98S 

   Collins, NY 14034   Arcade, NY 14009 

     

   Picked Up Delivered  Picked Up Delivered 

Gravel Products     

Bank Run   $5.95  $7.95   $4.95  $9.95 

 

Screened Gravel  

     1"    $7.95  $9.95   $5.95  $10.95        

     2"    $7.20  $9.20   $5.45  $10.45         

     3"        $7.20  $9.20   $5.45  $10.45                 
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     4"             No Bid  No Bid   $5.45  $10.45 

        

Oversize Rock-No more than 10% less than 2” on 

  2” to –8”    $9.15  $11.15   $7.45  $12.45       

  8” & up     $44.00  $46.00   $10.00  $15.00 

    

Crusher Run–2” $8.25  $10.25   $6.20  $10.45                    

-2”C/R Gravel H.H. $9.85  $11.85   $7.50  $12.50  

 

Limestone Products              

#1ACrushed Stone $20.45  $22.45   No Bid  $19.50    

#1 Crushed Stone No Bid  No Bid   No Bid  $14.50       

#1 & #2 Crushed  

    Stone Mixed No Bid  No Bid   No Bid  $17.00  

  

Surge Rock- 

6”-8”    $16.25  $18.25   No Bid  $15.00                

8” & up  $25.00  $27.00   No Bid  $16.50 

 

Topsoil 

Screened   $20.40  $24.40   $15.00  $20.00               

Unscreened   $13.40  $15.40   $12.50  $17.50  

 

 

   Waterman’s Gravel, LLC  Lafarge North America 

   12316 Vaughn Street   75 Pineview Drive, Suite 100 

   East Concord, NY 14055  Amherst, NY 14228 

     

   Picked Up Delivered  Picked Up Delivered 

Gravel Products     

Bank Run   $4.75  $7.75   $2.10  $6.10 

 

Screened Gravel  

     1"    $7.00  $10.00   $6.00  $10.00       

     2"    $5.35  $8.35   $6.00  $10.00         

     3"        $5.35  $8.35   No Bid  No Bid                

     4"             $5.35  $8.35   No Bid  No Bid 

        

Oversize Rock-No more than 10% less than 2” on 

  2” to –8”    $7.85  $10.85   No Bid  No Bid  

  8” & up     $50.00  $53.00   No Bid  No Bid 

    

Crusher Run–2” $8.75  $11.75   $5.25  $9.25  

-2”C/R Gravel H.H. $10.75  $13.75   No Bid  No Bid  

 

Limestone Products              

#1ACrushed Stone No Bid  No Bid   $11.25  $18.45    

#1 Crushed Stone No Bid  No Bid   No Bid  No Bid      

#1 & #2 Crushed  

    Stone Mixed No Bid  No Bid   $15.00  $22.20 

  

Surge Rock- 

6”-8”    No Bid  No Bid   $9.00  $17.40                

8” & up  No Bid  No Bid   $12.00  $22.40 

 

Topsoil 
Screened   $21.00  $24.00   No Bid  No Bid      

Unscreened   $15.00  $18.00   No Bid  No Bid 
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NOTES:      

McEwan Trucking – Included another bid for 1” screened stone $8.75.  Delivery to Town 

Highway Dept. $1.75 per ton for any product.          

 

Gernatt Asphalt – Topsoil Bid for Screened is Collins Plant Only.  Topsoil Bid for Unscreened 

is Springville Plant. 

      

Lafarge North America – Gravel Products location: 1043 Delevan Elton Road, Delevan, NY 

14043.  Limestone Products location:  400 Hinman Road, Lockport, NY 14094 

    

All prices per ton.  All bids included signed non-collusion statements. 

 

Highway Supt. Dains will review the bids and make his recommendations to the Town Board at 

their May 10
th

 meeting. 

   

Supervisor Eppolito closed the bid opening at 9:38 a.m. 

 

     

 

     __________________________________________ 

     Darlene G. Schweikert 

     Town Clerk 

 

 

 

 


